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Speech Publisher 

The beginning and the end of a research work are just 
like stepping on the highway of growth that begins 
with sowing the seeds of questions in the fertile land 
of a researcher's mind and ends with harvesting the 
ripe crops [of scientific products]. However the end of 
this process ushers in a new era of growth. This is, 
because the new results bring about greenery, 
refreshment and bliss. They also pave the way for 
asking new questions and collecting new cultivable 
seeds. Questions are link seeds that grow according to 
the needs of time and the abilities of the researchers, 
promoting cultures and civilizations. 

Quick dissemination of information made available 
by means of new modern technologies, is link a fast 
blowing wind bringing with itself the seeds of new 
questions from far distances to a curious mind and 
providing diversity and refreshment to other civilizations. 

Undoubtedly management and awareness play a 
crucial role in accelerating this process. 
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Given its universal mission, its place among 
seminaries and the necessity of diversity in manpower, 
Al-Mustafa International University deems it necessary 
to play an effective role in bringing about a suitable 
climate for research activities. Creating essential 
infrastructures, optimal management of existing 
facilities and supporting religious studies are some of 
the main tasks of the Research Department of Al-
Mustafa International University. 

By organizing volunteer scientific struggles and 
encouraging current motivations, we hope that we can 
improve religious studies through out the world. 
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